
 
 

Regent Hong Kong Celebrates the 43rd Hong Kong Film Awards 
as Official Hotel Partner 

 

   
 

30 April 2025 (Hong Kong SAR) – As the curtain gracefully falls on the 43rd Hong Kong Film Awards 
(HKFA), Regent Hong Kong proudly reflects on its role as the official hotel partner for this prestigious 
celebration of cinema. This iconic event not only recognizes the remarkable achievements within the 
film industry but also underscores the vibrant cultural tapestry that defines Hong Kong.  
 
This year, the collaboration between Regent Hong Kong and the HKFA has been stronger than ever, 
enhancing the experience for nominees and guests alike. The prestigious HKFA Goddess Trophy 
arrived at Regent Hong Kong, proudly displayed against the breathtaking backdrop of the Victoria 
Harbour skyline. This iconic symbol of cinematic excellence serves as a tribute to the magic of film, 
celebrating the artistry that captivates audiences.  
 
In keeping with the spirit of this special occasion, guests at Qura Bar could indulge in the exclusive 
Goddess Choice Cocktail. This luxurious blend, inspired by creativity and glamour, is finished with 
shimmering golden accents—perfectly embodying the essence of the HKFA.  
 
In the days leading up to the ceremony, the atmosphere at Regent Hong Kong was charged with 
anticipation. Movie stars, acclaimed directors, and industry luminaries gathered at our esteemed hotel, 
reveling in the luxurious accommodations and world-class services we offer. As they donned their finest 
attire, these celebrated figures prepared to step into their waiting limousines, ready to make their way 
to the Hong Kong Cultural Centre, where the magic of cinema would be honored.  
 
Every individual involved in this vibrant industry plays a crucial role in the rich legacy of Hong Kong 
cinema. From the talented actors who captivate audiences with their performances to the skilled 
directors, screenwriters, and crew members who work tirelessly behind the scenes, each contribution 
shapes the narrative of our cinematic heritage. We extend our heartfelt congratulations to all the 
nominees and winners. Your passion and commitment continue to illuminate the future of Hong Kong 
film, inspiring generations to come.  
 
As we reflect on this year's ceremony, we look forward to the next unforgettable chapter in the Hong 
Kong film industry. Regent Hong Kong remains committed to supporting the arts and fostering 
collaborations that celebrate creativity and storytelling. We eagerly anticipate sharing more shining 
moments together, reinforcing our dedication to being a pivotal part of Hong Kong’s cultural landscape. 
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About Regent Hong Kong  
Following a total transformation and reimagining as a majestic haven on Victoria Harbour, Regent Hong 
Kong has been named the #1 Hong Kong City Hotel, #2 among the 20 Favourite City Hotels in Asia 
and #7 among the 100 Hotels Voted Best in the World in the Travel + Leisure World’s Best Awards 
2024 readers’ survey. The hotel is also featured on the prestigious Travel + Leisure It List and Condé 
Nast Traveler Hot List. With a serene aesthetic by Hong Kong-born design visionary Chi Wing Lo, the 
497 rooms and suites are Personal Havens of tranquillity with customised service by Regent Experience 
Agents. Suite guests can enjoy the exclusivity of Regent Club, a luxury residential retreat with service 
on your terms. Decadent dining awaits at six celebrated restaurants and bars with mesmerising 
harbourviews. An iconic white marble staircase leads to the large pillarless ballroom, where glamorous 
galas and Regent weddings are curated for everlasting memories, while bespoke events in ten versatile 
function rooms showcase unrivalled harbourviews.   
 
With a prime city centre location on the edge of Victoria Harbour in Kowloon, connected to K11 Musea 
at Victoria Dockside, Regent Hong Kong is steps away from the city’s rich cultural attractions, museums 
and key shopping, with local markets alongside luxury emporiums, and Harbour City on Canton Road, 
just a short walk away. 
 
At your doorstep is “Avenue of Stars (Tsim Sha Tsui’s harbourfront promenade), Star Ferry Pier, Art 
Square, Hong Kong Museum of Art, Space Museum and Cultural Centre. Within minutes of the hotel is 
the West Kowloon Cultural District – home to M+ (Asia’s first global museum of contemporary culture), 
Hong Kong Palace Museum (showcasing priceless treasures from Beijing’s Palace Museum) and Xiqu 
Centre (for Chinese Opera). 
 
When the day is done, return to Regent Hong Kong, your harbourfront home and an oasis of calm within 
the bustling city. You will feel a world away, while in the heart of it all.  
 
Discover more at https://hongkong.regenthotels.com/ 
 
About Regent Hotels & Resorts 
Guests have made grand entrances through the doors of Regent Hotels & Resorts for more than half a 
century. Born in 1970 and now, part of IHG Hotels & Resorts' luxury and lifestyle portfolio, Regent's 
collection of modern hotels and resorts are home to stays both serene and sensational. The type of 
experiences that spark stories and charm even the most seasoned of travellers. Regent Hotels & 
Resorts hotels are located in some of the globe's most inspiring must-see destinations, from urban 
streetscapes rich in culture to ports with breath-taking seaside views. An invitation to life's most scenic 
moments, Regent hotels are amongst the most well-known luxury hotels in the world, with ten open 
hotels including the exclusive Regent Phu Quoc, Regent Chongqing, Carlton Cannes – a Regent Hotel, 
Regent Shanghai Pudong and Regent Hong Kong. In 2024, IHG opens the first Regent in the Americas 
with Regent Santa Monica Beach, together with Regent Shanghai on the Bund and Regent Bali Canggu. 
A further 11 properties are due to open in the next five years in destinations including Jeddah, Kuala 
Lumpur, Kyoto, Sanya, Shenzhen, and Jakarta. For more information and to book, visit 
www.regenthotels.com. 
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